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GRIN Verlag Jul 2009, 2009. sonst. Bücher. Book Condition: Neu.
212x149x1 mm. This item is printed on demand - Print on
Demand Neuware - Seminar paper from the year 2005 in the
subject English Language and Literature Studies - Linguistics,
grade: 1,0, University of Potsdam (Institut für Anglistik/
Amerikanistik), course: Scots and the other languages of
Scotland, language: English, abstract: When people think of
Scotland the images they have in mind are usually very
restricted. Most of us combine the country with the myth of
Nessie, the Clans and their tartan culture, the good whisky, the
Highlands and the famous Highland Games. All these existing
images of Scotland make up a large part of the country's
culture but Scotland is more than that. Only the minority of us
might think of Scotland as a country with a long and
problematic history and just some are regarding the fact that it
has still not gained its entire independence. It is a country full of
contrasts and difficulties which you cannot only become aware
of when you consider the geographical situation but also the
social, political and cultural circumstances. A today's problem
resulting from Scotland's long history is the question of
Scottish...
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